
Public Notice

In accordance with 
Chapter 13 (Junk and 
Abandoned Vehicles) of 
the Code of Ordinances 
of the Parish of Calca-
sieu, Louisiana, it shall 
be unlawful for any per-
son to cause or maintain 
a public nuisance by 
wrecking, dismantling, 
abandoning or discard-
ing any junked item on 
the real property of an-
other, or to suffer, per-
mit or allow any junked 
item to be parked, left or 
maintained on his own 
real property.  
If the property owner(s) 
listed below should fail 
to remove the following 
junked item(s) from the 
described property by 
August 1, 2024, the Po-
lice Jury shall proceed 
as authorized by the 
aforementioned parish 
ordinances.  In the event 
the public nuisance is not 
abated in compliance 
with the ordinances and 
no hearing has been re-
quested in writing by the 
expiration date, the par-
ish Police Jury may enter 
the premises in question 
and remove or cause 
to be removed the junk 
items. All related costs 
for abatement will be as-
sessed to the owner(s). 
Should the owner(s) fail 
to pay the fees, a lien 
and privilege will be filed 
against the property and 
shall be added to the 
next ad valorem tax bill.
A violation in the form of 
junk and/or abandoned 
vehicles (specifically:  
plywood, construction 
debris, household gar-
bage, insulation, chairs, 
carpet, windows, doors, 
scrap metal, plastic con-
tainers, cinder blocks, 
glass, boxes, TV stand, 
as well as any associat-
ed junk) exists on prop-
erty located at 148 Moss, 
Parcel # 00027278B, To-
nya Rena Wells  Murray 
(Junk - PS-0524-6072).
A violation in the form of 
junk and/or abandoned 
vehicles (specifically:  
household garbage, as 
well as any associated 
junk) exists on property 
located at 1077 Hwy 27, 
Parcel # 00215392, Jo-
seph Franklin Beckworth 
ET UX (Junk - PS-0524-
6039).
A violation in the form of 
junk and/or abandoned 
vehicles (specifically:  
household garbage, 
camper, as well as any 
associated junk) exists 
on property located at 
North of 1077 Hwy 27, 
Parcel # 00227633, Cyn-
thia Crouse (Junk - PS-
0524-6040).
A violation in the form of 
junk and/or abandoned 
vehicles (specifically:  
sofa, old washing ma-
chine, plastic containers, 
as well as any associat-
ed junk) exists on proper-
ty located at 195 Kassy, 
Parcel # 01347641C, 
Kelli Ann Hebert Engel 
(Junk - PS-0524-5964).
A violation in the form of 
junk and/or abandoned 
vehicles (specifical-
ly:  construction debris, 
household garbage, tin, 
burn piles, wire fence 
material, as well as any 
associated junk) exists 
on property located at 
1503 Pine Meadows 
W, Parcel # 00939633, 
James Dwight Mouton Jr 
ET UX (Junk - PS-0624-
6105).
A violation in the form of 
junk and/or abandoned 
vehicles (specifically:  
metal table, chairs, PVC 
pipe, plastic container, 
two piles of assorted 
junk and debris, as well 
as any associated junk) 
exists on property lo-
cated at 2768 Avondale 
St, Parcel # 01341309, 
Shirley Jean McWilliams 
Moore (Junk - PS-0524-
6051).
A violation in the form of 
junk and/or abandoned 
vehicles (specifically:  
two refrigerators, trailer 
loaded with junk, two 55 
gallon plastic barrels, as 
well as any associated 
junk) exists on property 
located at 8045 Ilene, 
Parcel # 00473197, 
HUSKER PARTNERS 
WITH UNION BANK AS 
SECURED PARTY (Junk 
- PS-0624-6104).
A violation in the form of 
junk and/or abandoned 
vehicles (specifically:  
trailer loaded with junk, 
construction debris, 
scrap metal, as well as 
any associated junk) ex-
ists on property located 
at 709 Tallow, Parcel # 
00104795, Allen J Tra-
han (Estate) Et Ux c/o 
Rebbecca Link (Junk - 
PS-0624-6098).
A violation in the form of 
junk and/or abandoned 
vehicles (specifically:  
tan Jeep, green military 
Jeep, scrap metal, con-
struction debris, house-
hold garbage, tin, John 
Deere riding mower, as 
well as any associated 
junk) exists on property 
located at 3379 Luke 
Powers Rd, Parcel # 
00099414, Nolan Lee 
Stokeld ET UX (Junk - 
PS-0624-6111).

/s/ Dan Broussard, 
Chief Building Official
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